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Disclaimer 

The recommendations in this guideline represent the view of NICE, arrived at after careful 
consideration of the evidence available. When exercising their judgement, professionals are 
expected to take this guideline fully into account, alongside the individual needs, preferences 
and values of their patients or service users. The recommendations in this guideline are not 
mandatory and the guideline does not override the responsibility of healthcare professionals 
to make decisions appropriate to the circumstances of the individual patient, in consultation 
with the patient and, where appropriate, their carer or guardian. 

Local commissioners and providers have a responsibility to enable the guideline to be 
applied when individual health professionals and their patients or service users wish to use it. 
They should do so in the context of local and national priorities for funding and developing 
services, and in light of their duties to have due regard to the need to eliminate unlawful 
discrimination, to advance equality of opportunity and to reduce health inequalities. Nothing 
in this guideline should be interpreted in a way that would be inconsistent with compliance 
with those duties. 

NICE guidelines cover health and care in England. Decisions on how they apply in other UK 
countries are made by ministers in the Welsh Government, Scottish Government, and 
Northern Ireland Executive. All NICE guidance is subject to regular review and may be 
updated or withdrawn. 
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1 Review Questions  
 

In people aged 16 years or over with suspected acute respiratory infection (ARI):  

RQ 1.1 What are the signs, symptoms and early warning scores (EWS) that have been 
evaluated? 

RQ 1.2 What are the strategies for the triage of patients (for example, applying clinical 
prediction rules using signs, symptoms, EWS thresholds) to avoid serious illness? 

RQ 1.3 What is the clinical effectiveness and cost-effectiveness of different near-patient, 
rapid microbiological or biomarker tests alone or in combination to guide initial assessment 
and management in people aged 16 and over with suspected ARI? 

RQ 1.4 In people aged over 16, what is the diagnostic accuracy of near-patient, rapid tests to 
distinguish between bacterial and viral infection in suspected acute respiratory infection? 

 
 
 
 

 

 

 


